Wessington Springs School District Parking Lot Improvements

Wessington Springs, SD

Feistner Gravel & Excavation, LLC

VanderPol Dragline

Menning Excavating, Inc.

SPN Project #16670 - .. 39218 235th Street 1001 Hot Rod Road 25462 Cornerstone Avenue Engineer's Estimate
Bid Schedule A " ¢ Woonsocket SD 57385 Mitchell, SD 57301 Mitchell, SD 57301
tem# | Description Quantity unit Total unit Total ont Total ot Tol
) S Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1. |Mobilization 1 LS $12,100.71 $12,100.71 $55,375.00 $55,375.00 $71,299.61 $71,299.61 $59,000.00 $59,000.00
2 Remove Concrete Curb and Gutter 441 LF $7.80 $3,439.80 $15.00 $6,615.00 $11.90 $5,247.90 $10.00 $4,410.00
3 Remove and Dispose of Concrete Surfacing 106 SY $1.56 $165.36 $15.00 $1,590.00 $16.39 $1,737.34 $25.00 $2,650.00
4 Remove and Dispose of Asphalt Surfacing 629 SY $0.94 $591.26 $8.00 $5,032.00 $10.93 $6,874.97 $6.00 $3,774.00
5 Full Depth Asphalt Saw Cut 349 LF $7.80 $2,722.20 $10.00 $3,490.00 $7.77 $2,711.73 $6.00 $2,094.00
6 Full Depth Concrete Saw Cut 17 LF $15.61 $265.37 $25.00 $425.00 $11.66 $198.22 $15.00 $255.00
7 Salvage traffic sign (Handicap and Visitor parking) 6 EA $167.64 $1,005.84 $15.00 $90.00 $225.86 $1,355.16 $50.00 $300.00
8 12" PVC Storm Sewer 104 LF $89.67 $9,325.68 $96.60 $10,046.40 $82.64 $8,594.56 $50.00 $5,200.00
9 4" PVC Drain Tile 40 LF $23.41 $936.40 $55.20 $2,208.00 $65.29 $2,611.60 $35.00 $1,400.00
10 |2'x3' Type B Storm Inlet 2 EA $4,682.26 $9,364.52 $3,875.00 $7,750.00 $3,791.85 $7,583.70 $5,000.00 $10,000.00
11 Connect to Existing Storm Inlet 1 EA $390.19 $390.19 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,519.47 $2,519.47 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
12 |Concrete Curb and Gutter 740 LF $48.56 $35,934.40 $39.60 $29,304.00 $40.80 $30,192.00 $40.00 $29,600.00
13 |Concrete Fillet Section 70 SY $114.17 $7,991.90 $121.00 $8,470.00 $124.67 $8,726.90 $80.00 $5,600.00
14 5" Concrete Sidewalk 3,422 SF $8.30 $28,402.60 $8.40 $28,744.80 $8.67 $29,668.74 $8.00 $27,376.00
15 |Concrete Vally Gutter 71 SY $121.10 $8,598.10 $114.40 $8,122.40 $117.87 $8,368.77 $80.00 $5,680.00
16 |8" Reinforced Concrete Surfacing (Bus loop) 1,942 SY $100.97] $196,083.74 $88.00| $170,896.00 $90.78| $176,294.76 $80.00f $155,360.00
17 Asphalt Surfacing (2nd Street Patch) 20 TN $117.06 $2,341.20 $250.00 $5,000.00 $272.00 $5,440.00 $400.00 $8,000.00
18  |Gravel Base Course 1,050 TN $23.41 $24,580.50 $34.60 $36,330.00 $37.24 $39,102.00 $30.00 $31,500.00
19  |Geotextile Fabric 5,893 SY $4.36 $25,693.48 $3.10 $18,268.30 $3.40 $20,036.20 $5.00 $29,465.00
20 |Seed, Fertilize, and Hydromulch Disturbed Area 905 SY $0.70 $633.50 $3.00 $2,715.00 $5.08 $4,597.40 $2.50 $2,262.50
21 Type 3 Erosion Control Blanket 215 SY $6.32 $1,358.80 $6.00 $1,290.00 $7.49 $1,610.35 $10.00 $2,150.00
22 |Inlet Protection 3 EA $390.19 $1,170.57 $120.00 $360.00 $441.10 $1,323.30 $300.00 $900.00
23  |Place and Shape Topsoil 905 SY $17.17 $15,538.85 $9.00 $8,145.00 $7.15 $6,470.75 $6.00 $5,430.00
24  |Contractor Furnished Topsoil from Borrow 95 CY $32.78 $3,114.10 $30.00 $2,850.00 $73.37 $6,970.15 $15.00 $1,425.00
25  |Unclassified Excavation 1,700 CY $25.53 $43,401.00 $25.00 $42,500.00 $12.24 $20,808.00 $15.00 $25,500.00
26  |Parking Lot Striping (Bus Loop) 1 LS $2,196.62 $2,196.62 $2,280.00 $2,280.00 $453.33 $453.33 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
27  |Arrow Pavement Symbol (Bus Loop) 2 EA $19.27 $38.54 $60.00 $120.00 $56.67 $113.34 $100.00 $200.00
28  |Handicap Pavement Symbol (Bus Loop) 4 EA $57.81 $231.24 $60.00 $240.00 $56.67 $226.68 $150.00 $600.00
29 |[Set salvaged sign with new post 6 EA $716.79 $4,300.74 $420.00 $2,520.00 $368.33 $2,209.98 $150.00 $900.00
30 |New Visitor Parking Sign with New Post 1 EA $462.45 $462.45 $480.00 $480.00 $368.33 $368.33 $200.00 $200.00
31 New "Do Not Enter" Sign with New Post 2 EA $462.45 $924.90 $480.00 $960.00 $453.33 $906.66 $200.00 $400.00
32 |Type lll Barricades 6 EA $445.10 $2,670.60 $300.00 $1,800.00 $177.49 $1,064.94 $150.00 $900.00
TOTAL FOR BID SCHEDULE A ITEMS 1-32 INCLUSIVE $445,975.16 $465,516.90 $475,686.84 $429,031.50
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Wessington Springs School District Parking Lot Improvements

Wessington Springs, SD
SPN Project #16670
Bid Schedule A

Feistner Gravel & Excavation, LLC

39218 235th Street
Woonsocket SD 57385

VanderPol Dragline
1001 Hot Rod Road
Mitchell, SD 57301

Menning Excavating, Inc.
25462 Cornerstone Avenue
Mitchell, SD 57301

Engineer's Estimate

- . Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
ltem # Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
ALTERNATE ONE - Asphalt surfacing for east lot
Alt 1 .
ltem 1 Asphalt Surfacing 330 TN $0.00 $0.00 $289.17 $95,426.10 $200.00 $66,000.00
Alt 1
ltem 2 Gravel Base Course 950 TN $0.00 $0.00 $37.24 $35,378.00 $30.00 $28,500.00
1. |Parking Lot Striping (East Lot | Ls $0.00 $0.00 $453.33 $453.33 $2,000.00]  $2,000.00
P11 |Amow Pavement Symbol (East Lo ) EA $0.00 $0.00 $56.67 $113.34 $100.00 $200.00
TOTAL FOR ALTERNATE ONE ITEMS 1-4 INCLUSIVE NO BID NO BID $131,370.77 $96,700.00
ALTERNATE TWO - Concrete surfacing for east lot
It/::nz1 8" Reinforced Concrete Surfacing 1392 SY $92.78 $129,149.76 $88.00 $122,496.00 $90.78 $126,365.76 $80.00 $111,360.00
Alt 2
ltem 2 Gravel Base Course 650 TN $23.41 $15,216.50 $34.60 $22,490.00 $37.24 $24,206.00 $30.00 $19,500.00
ItglrthS Parking Lot Striping (East Lot) 1 LS $1,936.49 $1,936.49 $2,010.00 $2,010.00 $453.33 $453.33 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
P2 |Arrow Pavement Symbol (East Lot) 5 EA $115.61 $231.22 $12000 $240.00 $56.67 $113.34 $150.00 $300.00
TOTAL FOR ALTERNATE TWO ITEMS 1-4 INCLUSIVE $146,533.97 $147,236.00 $151,138.43 $133,660.00
ALTERNATE THREE - Asphalt surfacing for west lot
Alt 3 .
ltem 1 Asphalt Surfacing 505 TN $0.00 $0.00 $283.22 $143,026.10 $200.00 $101,000.00
Alt 3
ltem 2 Gravel Base Course 1200 TN $0.00 $0.00 $37.24 $44,688.00 $30.00 $36,000.00
| t':rtrfs Parking Lot Striping (West Lot) | Ls $0.00 $0.00 $566.67 $566.67 $3000.00]  $3,000.00
Alt 3 Arrow Pavement Symbol (West Lot) 2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $56.67 $113.34 $100.00 $200.00
TOTAL FOR ALTERNATE THREE ITEMS 1-4 INCLUSIVE NO BID NO BID $188,394.11 $140,200.00
ALTERNATE FOUR - Concrete surfacing for west lot
ltlz'rtn41 6" Reinforced Concrete Surfacing 2171 SY $80.93| $175,699.03 $73.00] $158,483.00 $76.05| $165,104.55 $70.00| $151,970.00
Alt4 | Gravel Base Course $23.41|  $22,239.50 $34.60|  $32,870.00 $37.24|  $35,378.00 $30.00|  $28,500.00
ltem 2 950 TN
It/:rtn43 Parking Lot Striping (West Lot) 1 LS $3,121.51 $3,121.51 $3,240.00 $3,240.00 $566.67 $566.67 $3,500.00 $3,500.00
Alt4 Arro“m“&"&“"ﬂ'myl (West Lot) 2 EA $115.61 $231.22 $120.00 $240.00 $56.67 $113.34 $150.00 $300.00
N R ; $201,291.26 $194,833.00 $201,162.56 $184,270.00
251D SCHEDULE A, ALTERNATE TWO AND FOUR $793,800.39 $807,585.90 $827,987.83 $746,961.50
. (All Concrete Surfacing)
Sy s TOTAZB® SCHEDULE A, ALTERNATE TWO AND THREE
» NO BID NO BID . i
5}— =: JEFFRE !IEEs.t Lgt daA&Eete Surfacing and West Lot Asphalt Surfacing) o $815,219.38 $702,891.50
== . TOTABE SCHEDULE A, ALTERNATE ONE AND THREE NO B
i m (East Lot and West Lot Asphalt Surfacmg) NO BID O BID $795,451.72 $665,931.50

and are to the best of my knowledge corre
v
ﬁ///
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